
NewApproachestotheStudyofGovernmentandPolitics

the state for any given time. For example, we may regard the Indian people as
onesuch
politicalcommunity.
The administration consists of Indian constitutional foundations, basic values
of
the politico-economic system, political parties, periodic elections and other
institutions
that arealliedwiththeIndiansystemofgovernment. TherulingeliteinNewDelhi
consists of major political authorities. The general systems theory provides a
broad
structure for the examination of politics. It provides the theoretical equipment
for both,looking at political phenomenon on a macro-level and the setting in
whichmicro-analysis

can be carried out. It keeps us conscious of the broad implications of political
actsand

institutionsand of therelationbetweenevents. It providesa large-scalemap of
the

politicalworld,a newpatternforthediscipline.

Inthegeneralsystemsstructure,therearecertainfundamentalconceptsthat

may be divided into three categories. Some concepts are primarily explanatory,
asfor

example, those distinguishing between open and closed systems, organismic
andnon-

organismic systems, such hierarchical levels as subsystems, orders of



interactionand

scale effects, such organizational aspects as integration, differentiation,
interdependence

and centralization and also such terms as boundaries, inputs and outputs
dealingwith

interaction of systems with their environments. Some concepts focus on
factorsthat

control and maintain systems. In this connection, the concepts of stability,
equilibrium

and homeostasis are introduced. Lastly, there are concepts that focus on
dynamicsor

change, both disruptive and non-disruptive. Here, the notions of adaptation,
learningand

growth, disruption, dissolution and breakdown, systemic crisis, stress and
strain,overload

ordecay,areintroducedandutilized.

Thegeneralsystemstheory appearstobestrikingfromthepointofviewof

empirical research. It gives us an excellent opportunity for fusing micro
analyticalstudies

with macro analytical ones. The notions developed by this theory opensup new
questions


